
Frequently Asked Questions 

 

Where is St. Ann football field? 

We will hold practice and home games at St. Ann football field  

24500 S Navajo Dr. Channahon IL 60410 

 

Do we need to be parishioners at St. Ann Catholic Church? 

You do not need to be parishioners at St. Ann or belong to the Catholic faith. 

What do I need: 

Football Helmet that has a valid new or reconditioned date sticker on the back, Practice 
jersey in your team color (SLW-silver/gray, LW- Forrest green, JV- white, V-gold) 
practice pants, cleats, athletic cup, preferred mouth guard, any extra desired padding  

What can I expect from a practice? 

Football - While your coach can offer specifics about your team’s practices, you can 
assume that practices will happen rain or shine, unless there is lightening nearby. 
Unless otherwise specified all practices will require full pads after the acclimation 
period. Practices will normally last two hours, and will include conditioning, scrimmages 
and football drills. Please bring plenty of water and dress accordingly for the 
weather.  Parents are welcome to stay and watch. 

What can I expect on game day? 

Games start in the middle of August and run every weekend through early November. 
They could be held on either Saturday or Sunday. Generally, games start mid-morning 
with the Super Lightweight teams and progress to the older teams as the day goes on. 

There are eight regular season games and up to four additional playoff games. Usually, 
about four of those are home games. 

For home games St. Ann football and cheer families are welcome to line our home side 
lines. Bring your chairs, tents, and cheering voices. Games will be played in all weather 
unless there is lightening near by. Concessions provided by our very own home 
concession stand. Serving everything from hotdogs to walking tacos. The best in River 
Valley! The game schedule will be made available as soon as it is provided by the 
league.  



 

How can I help? 

Volunteer! St. Ann football and cheer is an entirely volunteer ran organization. From our 
coaches to our chain gang to our concessions. Volunteer jobs range from collecting 
trash and running gameday raffles, to shooting videos and organizing homecoming 
events. We will send out links to sign up for volunteer spots closer to the start of the 
season.  

 

What is the End-of-Season Banquet? 

This is our chance to recognize the hard work your kids put in throughout the season! 
Our Organization gathers as a whole to eat and celebrate the season’s highlights 
together.  Each athlete receives a participation certificate.  

 


